
TRIM CASTLE HOTEL
Trim Castle Hotel, where ancient history meets modern
elegance amidst breathtaking scenic beauty. Nestled in
the legendary Boyne Valley in Co. Meath, 40 minutes
from Dublin City. Our hotel offers unparalleled views of
the magnificent Trim Castle, inviting you to embark on a
captivating journey through ancient sites and
exhilarating outdoor adventures.

MEETING & EVENTS
Our flexible meeting spaces, filled with natural daylight
and offering views of Trim Castle, cater to a variety of
needs. From The Great Hall, The Tower Room, The
Castle View Suite, and The Bective Suite to smaller
meeting rooms, we provide versatile options ranging in
size from 30m2 to 440m2.

BEDROOMS
We offer 68 classic contemporary rooms including 3
Suites, that seamlessly blend comfort and style, providing
a truly restorative break. Each bedroom is complete with
Voya Organic bathroom amenities, Complimentary 
Wi-Fi and Parking.

DINING
Boann Café & Bistro, our all-day, 58-seater dining
destination with an outdoor terrace.
The Bailey Brasserie, overlooking Trim Castle, offers a
cosy and relaxing environment for evening dinner and
drinks. 
Jules Restaurant is the perfect location for a Leisurely
Sunday Lunch.
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